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The Journal of American Studies publishes work by scholars of various
nationalities on American literature, history, institutions, politics, econ-
omics, geography and related subjects. Articles which cross the conven-
tional borders between academic disciplines are particularly welcome, as
are comparative studies of American and other cultures. It also publishes
review essays, book reviews, and biennially, a list of theses on American
topics in progress and complete at British universities.

Contributors need not be members of the British Association for American
Studies. Decisions on articles submitted are normally made within three
months and those accepted published within a year. Details about the
submission of manuscripts are given on the inside of the back cover.

NOTE. The Editors are anxious to receive more material for their
newly-introduced NOTES AND COMMENT section. The purpose of
this section is to provide a forum for pieces of less than normal article
length and also to encourage readers to amplify or respond to points made
in articles and reviews. Items for NOTES AND COMMENT should be
sent to the Editor at the address given on the inside of the back cover.

The British Association for American Studies was founded in 1955 to promote

the study of the United States within the United Kingdom. It welcomes
applications for membership from people interested in the history, society,
government and politics, economics, geography, literature and thought of
the United States. It publishes a Newsletter twice yearly, holds an Annual
Conference, and provides other services for its members from time to time.
Enquiries concerning current subscription rates and applications for
membership should be addressed to the Secretary, Mr R. A. Burchell,
Department of American Studies, University of Manchester, Manchester
Mi3 9PL, England.
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