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Journal of Policy History

The Journal of Policy History provides an interdisciplinary forum for scholars concerned with
the application of historical perspectives to public policy studies. The journal aims to
encourage research into the formation and development of public policy while encouraging
the application of diverse methods and theories to public policy and their politics within a
historical perspective. In addition to social scientists and historians, the journal seeks to
inform policy makers through a historical approach to public policy.

The Journal of Policy History is intended to give voice to scholars interested in understand-
ing public policies and their development through historical inquiry and interpretation.
The journal publishes historical studies of specific policy areas and policy institutions, and
explores continuities and shifts in policy over time. The journal encourages interdisciplinary
research into the origins and development of public policy in the United States and other
countries. Comparative historical approaches to the development of public policies are also
welcomed.

Manuscripts should be typed double-spaced with end notes following the text and gener-
ally should not exceed 30 typewritten pages. Manuscripts accepted for publication will be
reviewed anonymously, and authors' names, including positions, addresses, and phone
numbers, should appear only on the title page. Four copies of a manuscript, and a biographi-
cal sketch of no more than 50 words, should be sent to the Editor, Journal of Policy History,
Saint Louis University, 3800 Lindell Blvd., P.O. Box 56907, St. Louis, MO 631560907.

The Journal of Policy History (ISSN 0898-0306) is published quarterly by The Pennsylvania
State University Press, USB 1, Suite C, University Park, PA 16802. Annual subscription
rates: U.S.A.: Individuals $29.50/yr.; Institutions $43./yr. Outside U.S.A.: Individuals,
$35./yr.; Institutions $50./yr. All correspondence of a business nature, including subscrip-
tions, permissions, advertisements, and changes of address, should be addressed to The Penn
State Press. Subscribers are requested to notify the Press and their local postmaster immedi-
ately of change of address. POSTMASTER: Send address changes to The Penn State Press,
USB 1, Suite C, University Park, PA 16802. E-mail Address: PSPjournals@psu.edu

This journal is registered with the Copyright Clearance Center, 222 Rosewood Drive,
Danvers, MA 01923. Libraries and other users registered with the CCC may photocopy any
article in the journal provided that a base fee of $1.00 per copy is paid directly to the CCC.
This authorization does not extend to copies made for duplicating an entire issue, for
creating anthologies, for advertising, or for reselling. For information about multiple copy-
ing for classroom use, write to the Permissions Manager, The Penn State Press, at the address
above.

The journal is submitted to the following for indexing: P.A.I.S. International, Humanities
Abstracts, Institute for Scientific Information, University Microfilms Inc., Sage Publica-
tions, Sociological Abstracts, Historical Abstracts, and IBZ-International Bibliography of
Periodical Literature.
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