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Decca has recently been awarded a 
Ministry of Defence contract to supply 31 
Instrument Landing Systems for Royal Air 
Force airfields. The Contract includes 
airfield surveys, installation and logistic 
support with an option for a further 11 
systems. 

The Decca 811ILS System is based 
on the very successful Wilcox Electric 
(USA) design for which orders have been 
received for over 700 installations and is 
designed in modular format enabling the 
different ICAO categories of equipment 

to be readily supplied. 
This equipment extends the already 

wide range of Decca electronics for 
aviation which includes Doppler Systems, 
airborne Decca Navigator, Loran and the 
Mona R-Nav System. 

The Company manufactures airborne 
VHF Nav/Comm and DME equipment, 
the Decca range of ground and airborne 
electronics also includes CAA approved 
NDB and DVOR, and TACAN. 

Decca is also a major supplier of 
Electronic Warfare systems, ASMI and 
Communications equipment. 
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