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Notice to contributors 
The Psychiatric Bulletin publishes original 
and scientific papers, brief review articles 
and opinion pieces dealing with treatment 
of mental disorders, administration, audit 
and management of psychiatric services and 
training in psychiatry. The Psychiatric Bulletin 
focuses on matters relevant to everyday 
clinical practice and management in 
psychiatry. The Psychiatric Bulletin will 
prioritise articles that are of practical 
clinical relevance, topical and accessible. 

All original articles are peer reviewed. 
Authors should send three copies of their 
submission, typed double-spaced with wide 
margins, and give a total word count. A 
good length is 1500 words. Longer papers 
are likely to be returned to the authors for 
editing before being sent to referees. A 
structured abstract of 100-120 words 
(headings to include aims and method, 
results and clinical implications) should be 
included with all original scientific papers. A 
summary of approximately 100 words 
should precede review articles. Authors are 
encouraged to limit advice on referencing 
(Harvard system), presentation of statistical 

information and the style of tables and 
figures, please refer to instructions to 
authors in the British Journal of Psychiatry. 

Papers on audit must demonstrate a 
completed audit cycle. Correspondence is 
welcome; letters should be no longer than 
250 words (please give word count) and 
include no more than three references, and 
no tables or diagrams. Letters can be e­
mailed to csantossinclair@rcpsych.ac.uk. 
The correspondence editor will use a 
standard letter to inform authors if their 
letter is to be published or not. Book 
reviews should be no longer than 500 words. 

If an individual patient is described, the 
patient should read the report before 
submission, and written consent must be 
obtained from the patient or an authorised 
person. Contributors should be aware of 
the risk of complaint by patients in respect 
of defamation and breach of confidentiality. 

All material submitted should be 
accompanied by a covering letter to the 
editor signed by all authors. Contributions 
are accepted for publication on the condi­
tion that their substance has not been 
published or submitted elsewhere. 
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